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This book is an extended collection of contributions that wereoriginally subm- ted to the 1st International
Workshop on Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval (AMR 2003), which was organized as part of the 26th German
Conference on Arti?cial Intelligence (KI 2003),and held during September 15–18,2003at the University of
Hamburg, Germany. Motivated by the overall success of the workshop – as revealed by the stimulating
atmosphere during the workshop and the number of very interested and active participants – we ?nally
decided to edit a book based on revised papers that were initially submitted to the workshop. Furthermore,
we invited some more introductory contributions in order to be able to provide a conclusive book on current
topics in the area of adaptive multimedia retrieval systems. We hope that we were able to put together a
stimulating collection of articles for the interested reader. We like to thank the organizationcommittee of the
26th German Conference on Arti?cial Intelligence (KI 2003) for providing the setting and the admin- trative
support in realizing this workshop as part of their program. Especially, we like to thank Christopher Habel
for promoting the workshop as part of the conference program and Andreas Gun ¨ ther for his kind support
throughout the organization process.
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From reader reviews:

Juanita Jones:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are reading
whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book when they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003,
Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in
Computer Science).

Elisabeth McBee:

The book Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany,
September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in Computer Science) can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we
leave a very important thing like a book Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR
2003, Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in
Computer Science)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can
give many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or
details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Adaptive
Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16,
2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in Computer Science) has simple shape however
you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and
read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Eric Kyler:

This Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany,
September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in Computer Science) book is
not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is
information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper an individual
read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International
Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers
(Lecture Notes in Computer Science) without we recognize teach the one who reading through it become
critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International
Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers
(Lecture Notes in Computer Science) can bring any time you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cell phone. This
Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany, September
15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in Computer Science) having excellent



arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Catharine Rosol:

This Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR 2003, Hamburg, Germany,
September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in Computer Science) is great
reserve for you because the content that is full of information for you who have always deal with world and
also have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it information accurately using great plan
word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole
info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with
wonderful delivering sentences. Having Adaptive Multimedia Retrieval: First International Workshop, AMR
2003, Hamburg, Germany, September 15-16, 2003, Revised Selected and Invited Papers (Lecture Notes in
Computer Science) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous just one.
We can say that no book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that.
So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?
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